Ariana Robert

From: Carolyn

Sent: g | ~ Monday, June 15, 2009 8:49 PM

To: Ariana Robert

Subject: RE: Invoice from Awning Solutions, Inc.

Importance: High

Ariana -

Thank you for the invoice. If you can have the guys drop off the curtain, I will install
1t -

Please deduct 5120 from the final bill and charge to the c¢redit card that Manny has.
Many thanks for a great job - Carolyn R

————— Original Message-----
From: Ariana Robert [mailto:ARobertlawningsoliutions.net]
sent: Monday, June 15, 2009 9:31 AM

ro:

Subject: Invoice from Awning Sclutions, Inc.

Dear Carolyn,

Wanted to let you know that we plan on 1nstalling the curtaln on Tuesday of this week.
Hopefully that's ok.

Please call us 1f you have any questions. Thanks so much!
Sincerely,
Arlana Robert~ Office Manager

Awning Soluticons, Inc.

(6l9) 2360316




